
Tuesday, January 12, 2010       THE NORTON TELEGRAM	 Page 7

For help
with your

advertising
needs please
give Dana
a call 877-

3361

ORDINANCE NO. 1594
Published in The Norton Telegram on Tuesday, January 12, 2010

                                              1 (T)
ORDINANCE NO. 1594

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER IV, SECTION ONE
OF THE NORTON CITY CODE RELATING TO BUILDING CODES

AND ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
WITHIN THE CITY OF NORTON, KANSAS

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY
OF THE CITY OF NORTON, KANSAS:
Section 1:  Section 4-101 of the Code of the City of Norton is hereby amended to 
read as follows:

Section 4-101 BUILDING CODES INCORPORATED. That a certain standard 
code known as the International Building Code, 2006 Edition, published by 
the International Code Council is hereby incorporated by referenced and 
made a part of this article. That there shall be no fewer than three copies of 
the International Building Code, 2006 Edition, kept on file in the City Clerk’s 
Office and kept available for inspection by the public at all reasonable hours. 
That at least one copy of the standard code shall be marked “Official Copy 
as incorporated by Ordinance No. 1594.” All sections or portions of the filed 
copies of the standard code shall be clearly marked to show deletions from 
the standard code.
That the following sections are hereby revised:

Section 101.1. Insert: City of Norton, Kansas.
Section 1612.3 Insert: City of Norton, Kansas.
Section 1612.3. Insert: July 16th, 1987.
Section 3410.2. Insert: The adoption of this code.

Section 2: Section 4-107 of the Code of the City of Norton is hereby amended to 
read as follows:

Section 4-107 PERMIT REQUIRED.
a. Before beginning any building, construction, or repair work, a builder or 
building contractor shall apply to the building inspector and obtain a permit 
to do such work. All such work shall meet the building code requirements. 
An owner must also apply for a permit if the owner does the work but an 
owner is not subject to a late application fee.
b. All applications for permits shall be made on suitable forms provided 
by the city.
c. The application shall be accompanied by a $5 permit fee.
d. A builder or building contractor who does not apply for a permit prior 
to beginning the construction may be charged a late application fee. That 
said late fee may be assessed at $5.00 per day for any day the permit was 
required and not applied for or obtained.
e. Section 105.2 of the International Building Code, as in effect, shall be 
amended to include: “Exterior surface work of a structure, including 
the walls and roof, so long as the structural framework of the building 
is not repaired, modified or enlarged.”

Section 3: That any ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are 
hereby repealed.
Section 4: That any section or phrase of this ordinance is for any reason, held to 
be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining 
portions of this ordinance.
Section 5: That nothing in this ordinance or in the Building Code hereby adopted 
shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights 
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause of action acquired or existing, under 
any act or ordinance hereby repealed; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of 
any character be lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance.
Section 6: This ordinance becomes effective upon publication in the official city 
newspaper.
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Governing Body of the City of Norton, Kansas, 
this 6th day of January, 2010.

David N. Corns, Mayor
Attest:
Darla R. Ellis, City Clerk 

•PUBLIC NOTICE•
ORDINANCE NO. 1596

Published in The Norton Telegram on Tuesday, January 12, 2010
                                              1 (T)

ORDINANCE NO. 1596
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ARTICLE IV, SECTION THREE OF

THE NORTON CITY CODE RELATING TO THE ELECTRICAL CODE
AND ADOPTING THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 2008

WITHIN THE CITY OF NORTON, KANSAS
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY
OF THE CITY OF NORTON, KANSAS:
Section 1:  Section 4-301 is hereby amended to read:

Section 4-301. UNIFORM NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE. That a certain
Standard code known as the National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, pub-
lished by the National Fire Protection Association is hereby incorporated 
by reference and made a part of this Article. That there shall be no fewer 
than three copies of the National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, kept on file 
in the City Clerk’s Office and kept available for inspection by the public at 
all reasonable hours. That at least one copy of the standard code shall be 
marked “Official Copy as incorporated by Ordinance No. 1596.” All sections 
or portions of the filed copies of the standard code shall be clearly marked 
to show deletions from the standard code.

Section 2: That any ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are 
hereby repealed.
Section 3: That any section or phrase of this ordinance is for any reason, held to 
be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining 
portions of this ordinance.
Section 4: That nothing in this ordinance or in the Electrical Code hereby adopted 
shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights 
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause of action acquired or existing, under 
any act or ordinance hereby repealed; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of 
any character be lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance.
Section 6: This ordinance becomes effective upon publication in the official city 
newspaper.
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Governing Body of the City of Norton, Kansas, 
this 6th day of January, 2010.

David N. Corns, Mayor
Attest:
Darla R. Ellis, City Clerk

•PUBLIC NOTICE•
ORDINANCE NO. 1597

Published in The Norton Telegram on Tuesday, January 12, 2010
                                              1 (T)

ORDINANCE NO. 1597
AN ORDINANCE REPEALING SECTION 4-501 THROUGH 4-504
AS THEY RELATED TO THE MINIMUM HOUSING CODE, AND

ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE
CODE WITHIN THE CITY OF NORTON, KANSAS

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY
OF THE CITY OF NORTON, KANSAS:
Section 1:  Sections 4-501 through 4-504 as they relate to the Minimum Housing 
Code, also known as the Uniform Housing Code, are hereby repealed.
Section 3: A New Section 4-501 of the Code of the City of Norton shall read as 
follows:
Section 4-501 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE INCORPORATED. That a 
certain standard code known as the International Property Maintenance Code, 
2006 Edition, published by the International Code Council is hereby incorporated 
by referenced and made a part of this article. That there shall be no fewer than 
three copies of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2006 Edition, kept 
on file in the City Clerk’s Office and kept available for inspection by the public at 
all reasonable hours. That at least one copy of the standard code shall be marked 
“Official Copy as incorporated by ordinance No. 1597.” All sections or portions 
of the filed copies of the standard code shall be clearly marked to show deletions 
from the standard code.

The following sections are hereby revised
Section 101.1 Insert: City of Norton, Kansas.
Section 102.3 Insert: National Electrical Code in place of ICC Electrical 
Code.
Section 103.5 Insert: That the City shall adopt a schedule of fees by Resolu-
tion which may be amended from time to time.
Section 201.3 Insert: National Electrical Code in place of ICC Electrical 
Code.
Section 302.4 Insert: 8 inches.
Section 304.14 Insert: April 1st, September 30th.
Section 602.3. Insert: October 1st, March 30th.
Section 602.4. Insert: October 1st, March 30th.
Section 604.2 Insert: National Electrical Code in place of ICC Electrical 
Code.

Section 4: A New Section 4-502 of the Code of the City of Norton shall read as 
follows:
4-502 DEFINITIONS. Where the term “Code Official” is referred to in the Interna-
tional Property Maintenance Code, such term shall include the Building Inspector 
or Code Enforcement Officer for the City.
Section 5: A New Section 4-503 of the Code of the City of Norton shall read as 
follows:
4-503 BOARD OF APPEALS. Where the term “Board of Appeals” is used in the 
International Property Maintenance Code, such Board shall be hereby established 
consisting of the members of the governing body. The board shall consider appeals 
in accordance with those procedures outlined in Section 111 of the international 
Property Maintenance Code.
Section 6: A New Section 4-504 of the Code of the City of Norton shall read as 
follows:
4-504 PENALTY. The violation of any provision of this article shall be deemed to 
be a misdemeanor; and any person, firm, association, partnership, or corporation 
convicted thereof shall be punished by a fine of not less than $100 or greater than 
$500 per offense; and the city shall further have the authority to maintain suits or 
actions in any court of competent jurisdiction for the purpose of enforcing any provi-
sions of this article and to seek civil penalties in the amount of not less than $100 
or greater than $500 per offense and to abate nuisances maintained in violation 
thereof, and, in addition to other remedies, institute injunction, mandamus, or other 
appropriate action or proceeding to prevent such unlawful erection, construction, 
reconstruction, alteration, conversion, maintenance, or use, or to correct or abate 
such violation, or to prevent the occupancy of the building, structure or land. Each 
day a violation of this article shall continue shall constitute a separate offense.
Section 6: That any ordinance or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are 
hereby repealed.
Section 7: That any section or phrase of this ordinance is for any reason, held to 
be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining 
portions of this ordinance.
Section 8: That nothing in this ordinance or in the International Property Mainte-
nance code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding 
pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause of 
action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed; nor shall 
any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by 
this ordinance.
Section 9: This ordinance becomes effective upon publication in the official city 
newspaper.
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Governing Body of the City of Norton, Kansas, 
this 6th day of January, 2010.

David N. Corns, Mayor
Attest:
Darla R. Ellis, City Clerk

•PUBLIC NOTICE•

ORDINANCE NO. 1598
Published in The Norton Telegram on Tuesday, January 12, 2010

                                              1 (T)
ORDINANCE NO. 1598

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 7-301, 7-303 AND 7-304
OF THE NORTON CITY CODE RELATING TO FIRE CODES

AND ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
WITHIN THE CITY OF NORTON, KANSAS

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY
OF THE CITY OF NORTON, KANSAS:
Section 1:  Section 7-301 of the Code of the City of Norton is hereby amended to 
read as follows:
Section 7-301 FIRE CODE INCORPORATED. That a certain standard code known 
as the International Fire Code, 2006 Edition, published by the International Code 
Council is hereby incorporated by referenced and made a part of this article. That 
there shall be no fewer than three copies of the International Fire Code, 2006 Edi-
tion, kept on file in the City Clerk’s Office and kept available for inspection by the 
public at all reasonable hours. That at least one copy of the standard code shall 
be marked “Official Copy as incorporated by Ordinance No. 1598.” All sections or 
portions of the filed copies of the standard code shall be clearly marked to show 
deletions from the standard code.

That the following sections are hereby revised:
Section 101.1 Insert: City of Norton, Kansas.
Section 109.3. Insert: Misdemeanor, $100.00, 30 days.
Section 111.4 Insert: $100.00, $1000.00

Section 2: Section 7-303 of the Code of the City of Norton is hereby amended to 
read as follows;
AMENDMENTS. Chapter 33, Explosives and Fireworks of the Uniform Fire Code, 
Section 3301.1.3 is hereby deleted as to any sections in conflict with fireworks as 
allowed under Section 7-305 of the City Code.
Section 3: Section 7-304 of the Code of the City of Norton is hereby amended to 
read as follows:
Section 7-304. BULK STORAGE; FLAMMABLE LIQUIDS, L-P GASES. That the 
limits referred to in the International Fire Code, as hereby adopted, in which storage 
and flammable liquids in outside above ground tanks is prohibited, and the limits 
referred to as to bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are hereby 
established as follows: No above ground storage in excess of 55 gallons permitted 
except on the Rock Island Railroad right-of-way between South Second Avenue 
and South Graves Avenue. Provided, however, that liquefied petroleum gas may be 
stored in containers not exceeding 1,000 gallons in capacity in the Light Industrial 
District when installed in full compliance with the State Fire Marshal’s Regulations, 
and not within 50 feet of a highway.
Section 4: That any ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are 
hereby repealed.
Section 5: That any section or phrase of this ordinance is for any reason, held to 
be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining 
portions of this ordinance.
Section 6: That nothing in this ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall 
be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights 
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause of action acquired or existing, under 
any act or ordinance hereby repealed; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of 
any character be lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance.
Section 7: This ordinance becomes effective upon publication in the official city 
newspaper.
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Governing Body of the City of Norton, Kansas, 
this 6th day of January, 2010.

David N. Corns, Mayor
Attest:
Darla R. Ellis, City Clerk

•PUBLIC NOTICE•

Published in The Norton Telegram on Tues-
day, January 12, 2010                            (1T)

Board of County Commissioners met in 
regular session at the Norton County Court-
house December 31, 2009 to allow the fol-
lowing bills: K.S.A. 19-337. An itemized copy 
of this report is available for inspection in the 
County Clerk’s Office.

(*Juvenile Service Accounts)
County General . . . . . . . . . . . . $78,573.44
Road & Bridge. . . . . . . . . . . . . $37,260.41
Special Bridge . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $9,353.72
Ambulance  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $19,988.10
Appraiser’s Cost . . . . . . . . . . . . $8,991.45
County Health . . . . . . . . . . . . . $24,168.59
Economic Development  . . . . . . $4,080.47
Election . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $2,930.00
4-H Maintenance. . . . . . . . . . . . . $200.00
Noxious Weed. . . . . . . . . . . . . . $7,565.78
Solid Waste . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $8,248.46

*Court Trustee - State . . . . . . . . $11,729.47
*Case Management . . . . . . . . . . $10,806.53
*JISP . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $11,211.14
*Diversion  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $7,515.71
*Juvenile Intake . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $5,360.12

Absolute Shred . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 42.00
Advance Insurance Co . . . . . . . . . 308.40
Ag Valley Co-op  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2,898.93
Almena Senior Citizen. . . . . . . . . . 131.25
American Family Life. . . . . . . . . . 2,517.97
Amsterdam Printing & . . . . . . . . . . 107.74
Andbe Home Board. . . . . . . . . . . 2,000.00
Annon, Robert D . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 25.30
Archibald, Curt  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 141.47

*AT&T  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 697.84
Baumgartner Law Office . . . . . . . 1,536.00
Behavioral Interventions . . . . . . . . .119.70
Besse Medical Supply. . . . . . . . . . 121.56
Bird, Angela. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 94.05

*Braun, Jerry . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 270.00
Breit, Tom  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 654.41
Briggs Corporation  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 22.04
Buffalo Co Sheriff Dept . . . . . . . . . . . 6.00
Burger, Maggie . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 712.00

*BC/BS of Kansas/Cs Mgmt . . . . . 3,130.97
BC/BS of KS Inc/Bill Add. . . . . . 49,973.32
BG Consultants, Inc  . . . . . . . . . . 2,580.00
Canterbury Oral & . . . . . . . . . . . . . 465.00
Car Quest Auto Parts  . . . . . . . . . . 733.98
Cheyenne Co. Health Dept . . . . . . 482.00
City of Norton  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3,060.87
Clock Medical Supply Inc. . . . . . . . 208.87
Coca Cola Enterprises Inc  . . . . . . . 99.50
Coffey, Mike. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .211.17

*Colby Free Press . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 283.83
Colonial Supplement Ins . . . . . . . . 137.50

*Commerce Bank  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1,003.46
*ComputerPro Inc . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 19.90

Conard, Thadene Sue. . . . . . . . . . 183.65
Conseco Health Insurance . . . . . . . 44.30
Cook, Brent . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 446.16
Cooper, Elizabeth A. . . . . . . . . . . . . 84.00
Countryside Sales & Serv . . . . . . . . 12.00
Culligan Water Condition. . . . . . . . . 34.25
Cytocheck Laboratory . . . . . . . . . . 152.55
CEI Security & Sound . . . . . . . . . . 902.23
Daffer Construction . . . . . . . . . . . . 130.00

*Dave’s Oil Service, Inc. . . . . . . . . . . 92.81
Day-Timer Inc . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 128.22

*Decatur Co Clerk . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 289.82
Decatur Co Health Dept  . . . . . . . . 656.90

*Decatur County Dist Court . . . . . . . 120.30
Developmental Services . . . . . . . . 500.00
Downtown Carwash LLC. . . . . . . . . 74.46
Eakes Office Products. . . . . . . . . 2,313.04
Election Systems & . . . . . . . . . . . . 909.36
Elliott Law Office PA  . . . . . . . . . . 1,009.25
Emergency Medical. . . . . . . . . . . 1,345.60
Endzone Sports & Office. . . . . . . 2,206.35
Engel’s Sales & Service  . . . . . . . . 921.94
Engelbert, Susan. . . . . . . . . . . . . . .116.15
Enserv Midwest LLC . . . . . . . . . . . 122.76
Express Police Supply  . . . . . . . . . 890.72

DECEMBER  NORTON COUNTY BILLS
Federal Licensing, Inc.  . . . . . . . . . 124.00
File Safe, Inc . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 577.92
Flanigan Communication  . . . . . . . 150.00
Fleet Fueling . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 589.91
Foley Industries, Inc. . . . . . . . . . . 1,475.21
Foulston Siefkin LLP . . . . . . . . . . 2,917.50

*Frontier Ag, Inc. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 212.40
Galeton Gloves . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 328.36
Garrett Plumbing . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .119.90
Garrett’s Plumbing  . . . . . . . . . . . . 187.83
Geil, Alberta. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 130.00

*Griffiths, Karen . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 468.17
Grysch, Verla . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 15.50
Haake Co  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2,000.00
Hadley, Marilyn Y. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 130.00

*Hays Daily News . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 462.80
*Hi-Plains Co-op Assoc . . . . . . . . . . 488.44
*Highplains Mental Health . . . . . . . 4,480.00

Homestore. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 460.92
Ingenix. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 154.91
Ingram, Twila . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 20.00

*Insurance Planning Inc. . . . . . . . . 7,211.00
Intrust Card Center . . . . . . . . . . . 2,463.78
IEDC . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1,620.00
ING Aetna . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2,707.00
Jamboree Foods . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 48.09
Jay’s Woodwork Shop. . . . . . . . . . . . . .90
Jay’s Woodworking . . . . . . . . . . . . . .11.75
Jones, Jenda . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 26.47

*Juvenile Justice Authority. . . . . . . . . 78.03
Kahrs Law Office, P.A.  . . . . . . . . 2,851.97
Kansas Assoc of Counties  . . . . . . 350.00
Kansas Bar Association  . . . . . . . . 150.00
Kansas County & District  . . . . . . . 292.00
Kansas Payment Center . . . . . . . . 538.00
Kansas Sheriff Association . . . . . . 140.00
Kansas Withholding Tax . . . . . . . 8,706.17
Kansasland Tire Company  . . . . . 3,726.60
Keith, Brandi . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 292.30
Kincaid, Charles  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 54.00
Klein Mark Dr  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 276.00
Kowpoke Supply LLC . . . . . . . . . . . 53.24
Krizek Craig Dr . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3,971.00
KACSO . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 150.00
KEMA Treasurer . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 50.00
KPERS Wire Transfer . . . . . . . . 26,210.25
KS Dept of Health & Envir. . . . . . . . 25.00
Laurie B. Williams, Trustee . . . . . 1,084.00
Law Office of Paula . . . . . . . . . . . . 254.40
Lenora Senior Citizen . . . . . . . . . . 131.25
*Lewis Paint & . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 500.00
Linner, Natalie . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 52.94
Linweld  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 172.58
Lockwood Company Inc . . . . . . . 1,445.16
Main Street IGA. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 221.04
Maintenance Engineering . . . . . . . 724.77
Manatron . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1,347.00
Marble, Bryce  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 41.74
Maupin Truck Parts Inc . . . . . . . . . 177.64
McDowell, Rhonda  . . . . . . . . . . . . 151.65
McKinley, Dr. Jeff. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 200.00
Merck & Co., Inc . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2,203.67
Mid Kansas Maintenance . . . . . . . 277.91
Mid-American Research . . . . . . . . 170.41
Midwest Energy Inc. . . . . . . . . . . 1,608.76
Miller Aviation  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2,500.00
Miller, John  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 151.80
Monier, Janis . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 40.00
Morel, Janelle . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 554.49
Mortensen Computer Service 3,537.49
Murphy Tractor & Equip Co. . . . . . 319.39
New Look Body Shop . . . . . . . . . 4,226.00
Nex-Tech . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2,459.42
Nex-Tech-RENT . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 360.00
Nex-Tech-Wireless-LLC  . . . . . . . . 500.76
Northwestern Printer, Inc. . . . . . . . . 45.45
Norton Co EMS. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 50.00
Norton Co Hospital Board . . . . . . . 450.00
Norton Co Sheriff  . . . . . . . . . . . . . 100.00
Norton County Clerk . . . . . . . . . . 3,876.99
Norton County Health . . . . . . . . . . 470.00
Norton County Hospital . . . . . . . . 1,319.50
Norton County Road Dept. . . . . . 2,020.19

Norton County Senior . . . . . . . . . . 487.50
Norton County Soil  . . . . . . . . . . . . 250.00
Norton County Treasurer. . . . . . . . . 65.38
Norton Flowers, Gifts & . . . . . . . . . . 52.00
Norton Shop and Save . . . . . . . . . . 19.98
Norton Sports Center  . . . . . . . . . . . 12.65
Norton Telegram . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 37.40
NADA Appraisal Guide  . . . . . . . . . . 25.00
NW Kansas Regional  . . . . . . . . . . 500.00

*Office Works, Inc.. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 138.87
Oldham Co Sheriff Dept  . . . . . . . . . 40.00
Otter, Penny  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 157.25
Ozark Life Insurance . . . . . . . . . . . 135.90
Pamida Inc  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 126.26
Paul-Wertenberger Const . . . . . . . 900.00
Payroll Fed/fica Wire . . . . . . . . . 55,739.93
Penco Engineering, P.A. . . . . . . . 3,000.00
Pfannenstiel, Leslie . . . . . . . . . . . . . 30.80
Phillips Co. Health Dept  . . . . . . . . 216.45
Phillips 66-Conoco-76 . . . . . . . . . . . .71.11
Physicians Ref Lab LLC . . . . . . . . . 67.60
Pitney Bowes  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1,464.00
Pitney Bowes Inc. . . . . . . . . . . . . . 165.72
Postmaster  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 206.50
Prairie Land Electric  . . . . . . . . . . . 184.28
Prairie Wind Eyecare  . . . . . . . . . 1,232.18
Pre-Paid Legal Serv Inc  . . . . . . . . 295.95
Professional Fire . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 30.00

*Quill Corporation  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 69.69
R&S Digital Service, Inc  . . . . . . . 5,001.88
Rachow, Kathryn . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .11.74
Rawlins Co Health Dept  . . . . . . . . .711.80

*Raye’s Grocery Inc. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 8.79
Red Willow Co Sheriff . . . . . . . . . . . 19.16

*Redwood Biotech, Inc  . . . . . . . . . 1,175.25
*Redwood Toxicology Lab In . . . . . . 200.00
*Regional Prevention. . . . . . . . . . . . 425.00

Resource Management Co . . . . . . . 89.90
Roberts Truck Center  . . . . . . . . . . 622.92
Robson Oil Co., Inc . . . . . . . . . . 18,331.20
Rogers Disposal Service. . . . . . . . 287.00

*Ron’s Tire Service . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 35.19
Rooks Co. Health Dept . . . . . . . . . 237.10
Roy’s Sales & Service Inc . . . . . . 1,506.24

*S&T Communications LLC. . . . . . . 132.08
S&W Supply Company . . . . . . . . . . 44.91
Sally Schwenk Assoc, Inc . . . . . . 2,845.00
Sanofi Pastuer, Inc  . . . . . . . . . . . 2,075.69
Schemper, Kathleen L. . . . . . . . . . . 43.64
Schillig, Aden . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 60.50
Schrum Maintenance  . . . . . . . . . . 135.00

*Scott, Melanie  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 90.00
Sebelius & Griffiths LLP  . . . . . . . . 858.99

*Sebelius Building LLC . . . . . . . . . . 400.00
Securus . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 430.00
Share Corp . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 143.42
Shirk Lamont Dr  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 245.00

*Stanley Hardware. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2.38
Stiles, Diane  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 139.70
Swisher, Sheila . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 578.93
Technology Two Llc. . . . . . . . . . . . 335.00
Thomas Co Health Dept . . . . . . . . 240.10
Thompson, Kenneth S  . . . . . . . . . 154.06
Thompson, Richard. . . . . . . . . . . . 152.50
Thomson, Troy  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 677.25
Trail King Industries Inc . . . . . . . . . 175.55
Trego County . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 50.00
Tri city Auto Parts, Inc . . . . . . . . . . . 75.00

*Tri-Central Office Supply  . . . . . . . . 289.54
*Triplett Inc./Fuel Plus . . . . . . . . . . . 863.96

United States Postal . . . . . . . . . . . 920.00
Verizon Wireless . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 512.16
Waddell & Reed  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 480.00

*Wal-Mart Community . . . . . . . . . . . 269.34
Windscheffel, Tamara . . . . . . . . . . 266.50
Wyatt, Jane . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 199.10
Wyatt, Robert D. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 27.50
Wyeth Pharmaceuticals  . . . . . . . . 838.80
Xerox Corporation . . . . . . . . . . . . . 153.23
Yocum, Joni. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 24.83
Zee Medical Service Co  . . . . . . . . . 71.25

 • PUBLIC NOTICE •

CITY OF NORTON
ORDINANCE 1594 - ORDINANCE 1596 - ORDINANCE 1597 - ORDINANCE 1598

BY VEDA WOODS
New Year’s resolution #1. Have 

eyes and ears checked!
It rather gives one a start to hear 

the TV say, “A woman jumped 
over a bear and knocked down the 
Pope.” Well, I quickly realized it 
was a barrier and not a bear. Not 
wishing to be irreverent, I still got 
a chuckle out of it, and I do need 
to see an ear specialist.

The first thing my great grand-
daughter and I made after the 
Christmas rush was a carrot cake. 
She broke the eggs and sifted the 
flour, as well as a four year old 
with one arm in a cast can. She 
is young, but it may be better for 
her to learn now, when she wants 
to. She thought it looked “yucky” 
before it was baked, but liked it 
when it was done and so did I.

I have heard several say that 
this is the first Christmas they ever 
spent alone, including Margaret 
(Toots) Magers, Joyce Sumner 
and myself. But, considering 
the weather, we would not have 
wanted people on the road, and 
felt safe and snug at home. 

Toots’ New Year’s company 
were her daughter, Jane Engelhar-
dt from Norton; J.T. and Denise 
Guy and daughters, Kirsten and 
Kendra from Abilene and on 
Sunday Judy and Charlie Easton, 
from Quinter.

Joyce Sumner’s after Christmas 
company were Larry’s and Greg’s 
families on Sunday, and Ward’s 
family on New Year’s Day, which 
is also Joyce’s birthday. She had 
Merry Christmas, Happy New 
Year, and Happy Birthday all in 
one. The samplers I mentioned 
last time, Joyce made them from 
material given her from Leone 
Purton’s things.

Kathy Van Meter and Lloyd 
Frandsen celebrated gift open-
ing with her son, Kim and Jolene 
Nedjl and their family at Quinter 
on Saturday, Dec.26, and went to 
McCook on New Year’s Eve for 
supper and dance.

Dean and Rhonda Jolly took 
June to her granddaughter Jenni-
fer’s in Trenton, Neb., on Christ-
mas, then to Linda’s in McCook 
for a soup supper, then went home 
and refused to go further. He was 
brave to go that far in that blowing 
snow. June played cards Dec. 28 at 
the club in McCook and in Norton 
on Jan. 3.

The Wood family had their 
dinner and gift exchange at the 
Educational building in Norcatur 
on Dec.27. David had planned 
to be there, but was snowed in 
at Omaha, Neb. Those attending 
were his son, Toby and Jennie 
from Marysville, Hannah and 
Israel Jirak and sons of Prescott 
Valley, Ariz, Cari and Steve Riffel 
of Stockton, Sandra and Larry 
McNames of Grinnell, Carol and 
John Moye of Oberlin, and Adri-
enne Vacura and daughters, Kylie 
and Skylar.

LYLE NEWSLYLE NEWS

07 1-12-2010 Legals.indd   1 1/12/10   8:52:50 AM


