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Stanton
Nelson

Stanton is the son of Terry 
and Sara Nelson. Stan-
ton plans to attend the 
University of Kansas and 
double major in piano 
performance and finance. 
Intend to receive Mas-
ter’s and Doctoral degrees 
somewhere east (Julliard 
or Eastman). 

Northern Valley High School

Watsaporn
Pinyotan-
makorn

Watsaporn is the exchange 
daughter of Rich and 
Judy Wenzl. Watsaporn 
plans to go back to Thai-
land and take senior class 
again. I plan to attend the 
university in Thailand as a 
Political Science Interna-
tional Relations Major.

Northern Valley High School

Brandon
Pride

Brandon is the son of Bri-
an M. Schrieber. Brandon 
plans to attend Highland 
Community College and 
study Social Work.

Northern Valley High School
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