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Nolan Evans
Nolan, a freshman, is the
son of Scott and Alice
Evans.This is Nolan’s first
year on the Norton golf
team.

Josh Jackson
Josh, a senior, is the son of
Jim and Deb Jackson. Josh
has been on the golf team
for three years.

Blue Jay Booster Club
Norton, Kansas

Clay Madden
Clay, a junior, is the son of
Barry and Dana Madden.
Clay has been on the
Norton golf team for three
years.

Tosha Lyon
Tosha, a senior, is the
daughter of Kevin and Kelly
Lyon. This is Tosha’s second
year on the Norton golf
team.

Jordan Durham
Jordan, a sophomore, is the
son of Joe Durham and
Sarah Walkin. Jordan has
been on the Norton golf
team for two years.

Lacy Ellis
Lacy, a freshman, is the
daughter of Ron and
Shelley Ellis. This is Lacy’s
first year on the Norton golf
team.

Michael Ward
Michael, a sophomore, is
the son of Allen and Susan
Ward. Michael has been on
the Norton golf team for
two years.

Jordan Herman
Jordan, a junior, is the son
of Joe and Claire Herman.
Jordan has been on the
Norton golf team for three
years.

Pat Burton
Pat, a sophomore, is the
son of Gene and Jane
Burton. This is Pat’s second
year on the Norton golf
team.

Prairie Land Electric
Cooperative, Inc.

Norton, Kansas • 877-3323

201 E. Main • Norton • 877-3313 • Member FDIC

First Security Bank
and Trust Co. Inc.

United Northwest
Federal Credit Union
912 N. Archer • Norton • 877-5191 • Member NCUA

Rural Telephone/
Nex-Tech

117 N. Norton • Norton • 877-4135

USD 211
Norton, Kansas

Sharp Construction
W. Hwy. 36 • Norton • 877-3101

McMullen and
Wyatt Auctions
113 N. State • Norton • 877-3299

Bridges Group Ins.
117 N. Kansas • Norton • 877-4016
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